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PRACTICES IN SAFEGUARDING FUGITIVES FROM 
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Introduction 

As part of its inquiry into immigration law,' 
the Senate recently investigated 
Australia's non-refoulement obligations 
under the Convention against Torture and 
Other Cruel, Inhuman or Degrading 
Treatment or Punishment (Convention 
against Torture). The importance of such 
an investigation was emphasised in May 
1999 when the United Nations Committee 
Against Torture (UNCAT) handed down its 
first decision against Australia: Sadiq Shek 
Elmi v Australia (hereafter In this 
case, UNCAT found that Australia would 
be in breach of its obligations under Article 
3 of the Convention against Torture if it 
continued in its decided course of forcibly 
returning a Somali national to Somalia, 
where he would be in danger of suffering 
t~ r tu re .~  This article examines the issues 
raised in the SE case and looks at the 
implications that these issues have for 
immigration law in Australia. The nature of 
the Convention against Torture and the 
way in which Australia has sought to 
comply with the obligations it assumed 
upon signing and ratifying the Convention 
are e~amined.~ 

It is disturbing for Australia, a country that 
takes pride in its human rights record, to 
be informed by an international human 
rights committee that it is pursuing a 
course of action in violation of a 
convention which seeks to protect people 
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from one of the most extreme of human 
rights abuses. In defence of Australia's 
reputation, it may be postulated that SE's 
case is an anomaly; that it was the 
unfortunate result of misguided decision 
makers dealing with a difficult factual 
situation or with a poorly presented case. 
This may be suggested even though the 
likelihood of an aberrant decision should 
be minimised by the fact that cases are 
only admitted for hearing before the 
UNCAT once domestic remedies have 
been exha~sted.~ 

This article attempts to demonstrate that, 
seen in the context of Australia's 
immigration law and practice, the decision 
against Australia in SE's case is actually 
the foreseeable and likely result of 
Australia's failure to provide adequately for 
its "non-refoulement" obligations under 
Article 3 of the Convention against 
Torture. The gravity of this failure and 
hopefully the motivation for its remedy 
may be realised by recognising the nature 
of the Convention against Torture and the 
subject matter that it deals with. 

The Case of SE v ~ u s t r a l i a ~  

SE came to Australia in October 1997. He 
asserts that his life is in danger in Somalia 
because he is a member of the Shikal 
clan, whose members are easily identified 
by their lighter coloured skin and distinct 
accent. Members of the Shikal clan, he 
claims. are the target of other clans 
because of their wealth and because they 
refused to join or financially support the 
dominant Hawiye clan. His father, an elder 
of the Shikal clan, was shot by the Hawlye 
militia when he refused to "give over" one 
of his sons to them or to otherwise support 
the militia. SE's brother was killed when 
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the militia detonated a bomb in his home 
and his sister committed suicide after 
being raped three times by members of 
the Hawiye militia. 

Fullowing the refusal of the Department of 
Immigration and Multicultural Affairs 
(DIMA) to grant SE a protection visa in 
March 1998, SE sought review by the 
Refugee Review Tribunal (RRT). The RRT 
rejected his claim in May 1998. SE then 
made a request to the Minister for 
lmrnigration to use his discretion7 to 
overturn this decision, but in July 1998 the 
Minister declined to consider exercising 
his discretion. In October 1998 SE was 
told that he would be deported to 
Mogadishu. 

This decided course of deportation was 
not reversed despite a request by 
Amnesty lnternational that the Minister 
intervene. SE was not permitted by the 
Minister to lodge a second application for 
a protection visa, although it was readily 
determined that he had received 
inadequate representation for his original 
application and RRT appeal. In due 
course, the High Court refused to issue an 
injunction against his deportation on the 
grounds that there was ~ o t  a "serious 
question" of law to be tried. 

However, SE's deportation was delayed, 
through a serles of exceptiurlal ava111s. In 
summary, the captain of the aircraft 
designated to fly SE from Melbourne on 
29 October 1999 refused to have SE on 
board after he witnessed his distress. An 
Urgent Action was issued by Amnesty 
International on 18 November 1998'. 
followed by a protest by the Trades and 
Labour Council at Perth airport when the 
DlMA attempted to deport SE on 19 
November 1998. DlMA finally agreed to 
suspend his deportation after the UNCAT 
requested that they do so while they heard 
s t ' s  case. 

On 20 May 1999 the UNCAT decided 
against Australia. It stated that SE's 
deportation would be in breach of Article 3 
of the Convention against Torture, which 
obliges states not to refoule individuals to 
a country where they are likely to suffer 

torture. What makes this case disturbing is 
that there was (and is) no provision in 
Australlan domestic law requlrlng SE's 
case to be assessed in accordance with 
the provisions of the Convention, even 
though Australia has signed and ratified it. 
Since the circumstances of most asylum 
seekers do not allow them the opportunity 
to have their cases heard before the 
UNCAT, the case demonstrates the need 
for changes within Australia's immigration 
laws so as to ensure that Australia's 
treatment of asylum seekers does not 
offend against our obligations under the 
Convention. An appropriate change would 
be to introduce a humanitarian visa class 
based upon Article 3, together with a 
mechanism for reviewing removal 
decisions so as to ensure compliance with 
Article 3. 

The Nature of the Convention against 
Torture 

As noted above, the Convention against 
Torture seeks to protect people from one 
of the most extreme of human rights 
abuses. The World Conference on Human 
Rights in June 1993 described torture as 
"one of the most atrocious violations 
against human dignity"." The status of the 
right to be protected trom torture as one of 
the most basic of human rights is 
evidenced by its presence in all general 
human rights treaties, such as the United 
Nations Declaration of Human Rights 
(Article 5) and the lnternational Convenant 
on Civil and Political Rights (Article 7)", 
and its universal condemnation has 
allowed it to secure "the rare status of jus 
cogens".' 

The Convention against Torture not only 
prohibits torture, but aims for the global 
elimination of t~r ture. '~ Its non- 
refoulement provision (Article 3), focuses 
on the existence of serious harm which 
will be suffered if a person is returned to a 
country where he is likely to suffer torture, 
regardless of the character of the person 
who will suffer the harm or the connection 
of the harm with a specific ground. Article 
3 of the Convention against Torture states: 
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No State Party shall expel, return 
(refouler) or extradite a person to another 
Statc whcrc thcrc arc substantial 
grounds for believing that he would be in 
danger of being subject to torture. 

The abuse which torture constitutes a 
recognised here to be so extreme that the 
existence of a possibility of torture is the 
sole determiner of whalher an individual 
should be afforded protection. This 
reinforces a view of torture as one of the 
most serious of human rights abuses as 
well as recognising that the elimination of 
torture globally demands that states not 
only eliminate it within their borders but 
also recognise that they act as a member 
of a global community and have global 
responsibilities towards foreign nationals. 
Understanding the nature and aims of the 
Convention against Torture and the place 
of Article 3 within it is critical for deciding 
upon an appropriate domestic response to 
it. 

Australia's Response to the 
Convention against Torture 

Australia became a party to the 
Convention against Torture in 198714 and 
gave effect to several of its provisions in 
domestic law through the Crimes (Torture) 
Act 1988 (Cth). However, the terms of 
Article 3 were not given domestic 
legislative force by this legislation. In 
contrast, Article 3 shapes the Extradlion 
Act 1988 (Cth) which only allows a person 
to be extradited once the Attorney- 
General Is content that persorls will nu1 he 
tortured in the country to which they are 
extradited.I5 Asylum seekers are not 
protected by this provision because 
extradition is a mechanism designed to 
return foreign nationals wanted in relation 
tn alleged criminal offences by another 
country with which Australia has reached 
an agreement. 

In SE ~Austral ia '~ Australia implied that it 
has provided for its "non-refoulement" 
obligations under the Convention against 
Torture. One of the principal grounds on 
which the argument that SE's claim for 
Article 3 protection was without merit 
rcstcd, was that he had failed to gain a 
visa in Australia, despite exhausting 

domestic remedies. This argument shows 
that Australia had not changed its position 
since its first report to the UNCAT," in 
which it claimed to have provided for its 
Article 3 obligations through granting visas 
to refugees and permitting the Minister to 
grant visas on humanitarian grounds at 
hislher discretion.18 

However, it was not the facts of SE's case, 
but the provisions of Australian 
immigration law, which did not meet the 
requirements of Article 3 of the 
Convention against Torture. Even though 
protection visas and humanitarian visas 
can be issued by DlMA and the Minister, 
this does not guarantee that those eligible 
for protection in Australia under Article 3 
will receive it. This may be demonstrated 
by comparing the availability of and criteria 
relating to protection visas and 
humanitarian visas with the terms of 
Article 3. 

Protection visas 

Individuals will gain a cl 866 protection 
visaqg if they can satisfy the Minister for 
Immigration that they are a refugee.20 The 
definition of "refugee" is taken from Article 
1 of the Refugee Convention?' which 
defines a refugee as a person: 

who owing to a well-founded fear of 
bcing pcr;coutcd for reasons of religion, 
nationality, membership of a particular 
social group or political opinion, is 
outside the country of his nationality and 
is unablc or, owing to ouch fcar, ic 
unwilling to avail himself of the protection 
of the country. 22 

The problem with using this definition as 
the basis of the main on-shore 
humanitarian visa in Australia is that it 
does not cover all lndlviduals who are 
protected under Article 3 of the 
Convention against Torture. 

The focus of Article 3 is the existence of 
serious harm which will be suffered, rather 
than its connection with a specific ground 
or the person making the claim, as is the 
case with the Refugee   on vent ion.^^ 
Although both the Refugee Convention 
and the Convention against Torture seek 
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to protect people from being returned to a 
place where they will suffer human rights 
abuses, the elements which make up the 
relevant provisions differ. The extent of 
these differences emerges when we 
examine the character of the harm for 
which protection is granted under Article 3, 
the proof required, and who is protected 
from refou~ement.~~ 

The type of harm suffered 

To constitute "torture" within the 
Convention against Torture, the relevant 
act must be committed with the "consent 
or acquiescence of a public official or 
other person acting in an official 
capacity".29 Here also the scope of Ule 
provision is narrower than Article 33(1) of 
the Refugee   on vent ion.^^ Yet, there may 
.be little practical difference between the 
scope of the two conventions in this 
respect. 

Article 3 only applies to acts of torture.25 The notion of toiture was defined in this 
Torture is defined in article 1 as: manner because it was expected that 

criminal acts by private persons would be 
[Alny act by which severe pain or 
suffering, whether physical or mental, is 
intentionally inflicted on a person for such 
purposes as obtaining from him or a third 
person information or a confession, 
punishing him for an act he or a third 
person has committed or is suspected of 
having committed, or intimidating or 
coercing him or a third person, or for any 
reason based on discrimination of any 
kind, when pain or suffering is inflicted by 
or at thc instigation of or with the consent 
or acquiesceice of a public official or 
other person acting in an official capacity. 
It does not include pain or suffering 
arising only from, inhcrcnt in, or 
incidental to lawful sanctions. 

The European Court of Human Rights has 
distinguished torture from other inhuman 
treatment by on the basis of its severity 
and immoral purpose.26 In Ireland v United 
~mgdom," five interrogation techniques 
were deemed not to constitute torture, but 
instead inhuman and degrading treatment, 
because torture is constituted only by 
deliberately inhuman acts which cause 
extreme suffering.26 The UNCAT may be 
influenced to define tnrturc! more broadly 
than the European Court because, unlike 
the European Convention against Torture, 
only torture activates Article 3. 
Nevertheless, the principle of hierarchical 
abuse will still be maintained with torture 
being at the top of a hierarchy of abuse. 

Since other inhuman treatment constitutes 
"persecution", the scope of Article 3 is 
narrower than that of Article 33 (l) of the 
Refugee Convention with respect to the 
type of harm suffered. 

dealt with through .domestic legal 
 system^.^' The Convention against 
Torture is an instrument of international 
law and should not work in competition 
with domestic legal systems. It was not, 
however, intended to leave individuals 
without redress because the state where 
they suffer harm is incapable or disinclined 
to protect them. 

Individuals who find themselves in this 
position should be covered by the 
Convention by virtue of the phrase "with 
the consent or acquiescence of a public 
official." Governments will be taken to 
have acquiesced in torture if they do not 
act to prevent it. As an example of this, 
Rodley argues that acts done by 
paramilitary and other unofficial groups will 
be covered ~f publlc officials Ignore those 
acts.32 Furthermore, a report by the 
Special Rapporteur on Torture says that if 
a state does not intervene when quasi- 
public groups such as tribes commit 
human rights abuses it will be considered 
to have annsented nr acquiesced in the 
act.33 Further still, Copelon argues that a 
state may consent even to private acts of 
domestic violence when it fails to protect 
citizens from it.j4 

It is also consistent with the purpose of the 
public official requirement to interpret the 
phrase "those acting in an official capacity" 
as defacto governments, in circumstances 
where there is no official government. In 
SE v Australia Australia claimed that the 
applicant did not face torture as defined by 
Article 1 because those who threatened to 
harm him were members of "armed 
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Somali clans", not public officials or 
person acting in an official capacity.35 The 
UNCAT held that, given Somalia was in a 
state of civil war and without an official 
government, the factions in question came 
within the definition because they had set 
up quasi-governmental institutions and 
exercised powers similar to those used by 
legitimate 

Proving the existence of harm 

Article 3 requires that substantial grounds 
exist for believing that a person will be in 
danger of being subjected to t~rture.~' It 
uses a probability standard of proof and 
deals only with future risk, since its aim is 
to protect from harm rather than bring 
redress for past abuses.38 

What constitutes substantial evidence will 
be dependent upon a particular factual 
~ituation.~' Balabou Mutombo v 
Switzerland indicated that "substantial 
grounds" means that the risk of an 
individual being tortured is a "foreseeable 
and necessary consequence" of their 
return!' However, this is not a firm 
definition because it still requires an 
opinion as to what is foreseeable in the 
relevant circ~~rnstanr.ns and it has not 
been used as a test in later cases. 

As indicated by paragraph 2 of Article 3, 
the general human rights situation in a 
country should be examined in 
determining whether an individual is 
threatened by torture. However, this is not 
taken as an absolute or an exhaustive 
proof?' but as a means by which a view 
may be "~trengthened".~~ Following from 
this, although general human rights 
abuses exist in a country, Article 3 may 
not operate because the person in 
question is not at risk?3 Moreover, it may 
be held that a person is in danger of 
torture although their country does not 
have a constant pattern of human rights 
 abuse^.^ 

In assessing the significance of 
inconsistencies and contradictions within 
an applicant's story, the UNCAT has 
repeatedly stated that "complete accuracy 
is seldom to be expected by victims of 

tort~re."~ As well as considering the 
characteristics of torture victims, the 
UNCAT focuses upon the paramount aim 
of the article, which is to protect the 
security of individuals. Consequently, it 
has held that despite the existence of 
doubts regarding the facts of a case, the 
security of an individual must be 
ensured.46 

Taylor observes that Article 3 does not 
consider the subjective fear of an 
applicant in the way Article 33(1) of the 
Refugee Convention does.47 However, the 
practical significance of this distinction is 
minimal because, as Taylor notes, the 
subjective fear of a refugee must have an 
objective foundation by which a court is 
able to establish, under Chan, that there is 
a "real chance" they will be persecuted!' 

Moreover, the standard or proof required 
under Australian law seems greater than 
that required by the UNCAT. The 
Migration Act 1958 places the onus of 
proof upon applicants to ensure that the 
Minister "is satisfied" that they have a 
genuine fear based upon a real risk of 
persec~tion.~~ By contrast, under the 
Convention against Torture, the burden of 
proof, at least with regard to evidence of 
country conditions critical to an 
assessment under Article 3, is placed 
upon the state in which relief is 
In addition, the UNCAT is concerned that 
the paramount aim of Article 3, that 
persons be protected from torture, is met, 
despite doubts which ;ay exist 
concerning the facts of a case. 

Who is protected from refoulement? 

There are several significant differences 
with regard to the class of pcrsons 
protected from refoulement under the 
Refugee Convention in comparison with 
the class protected by the Convention 
against Torture. 

A refugee is someone who is part of a 
persecuted group. A refugee who is 
protected from refoulement is someone 
who is not protected or assisted by 
agencies other than the UNHCR (Refugee 
Convention, Article ID); is not a national 
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of the country where helshe resides 
(Refugee Convention, Article 1 E); has not 
committed a crlme agalnst peace, a war 
crime, or a crime against humanity 
(Refugee Convention, Article 1 F (a)); has 
not committed a serious non-political 
crime (Refugee Convention, Article 1 F 
(b)); has not committed acts "contrary to 
the purposes and principles of the United 
Nations" (Refugee Convention, Article 1 F 
(c)); and is not a danger to the security or 
the community of the country where 
helshe seeks refuge (Refugee 
Convention, Article 33 (2)). 

In contrast, a person is protected by 
Article 3 of the Convention against Torture 
regardless of characteristics such as those 
referred to in the Refugee Convention. 
"mhere are no preclusions for 
those ... considered to be criminals, 
national security risks, or even  torturer^."^^ 
In D v the United ~ i n g d o m ~ ~  it was held 
that protection should be given to a drug 
dealer. In Chahal v United Kingdom the 
successful applicant was an alleged 
terrorist involved with planning terrorist 
attacks in the country where he sought 
asylum. While these are decisions of the 
European Court of Human Rights, and the 
jurisprudence of the UNCAT may develop 
differently on this issue, the reasoning of 
the ECHR is important. In Chahal v United 
Kingdom the ECHR explained that a claim 
for protection under the Convention 
against Torture should be decided without 
regard to the applicant's conduct or 
national security because it is fundamental 
to democratic society that individuals be 
protected from torture and the irreversible 
harm caused by it.54 Such a broad 
approach is also consistent with the 
philosophy behind the Convention against 
Torture: that is, that all persons, 
regardless of their status, have a right to 
be protected from torture and that states 
have an interest in making the elimination 
of torture their highest priority within the 
decision making process. 

Those concerned with national security 
should be mindful of the following issues. 
First, the Convention against Torture does 
not require Australia to do anything more 
than ensure that lt does not return an 

individual to a country where they are at 
risk of torture. It does not impose upon 
Australia an obllgatlon to grant a torture 
victim permanent residence or refugee 
status. Australia may send torture victims 
to any country where they are not under 
threat of torture.55 This feature of the 
provision has been recognised by United 
States law. The United States offers 
asylum seekers under the Convention 
against Torture relief in two forms. Asylum 
seekers who do not meet the definition of 
a refugee but wtio meet the requirements 
of Article 3 are granted similar rights to 
refugees, including the right not to be 
deported and the right to work. Asylum 
seekers who meet the requirements of 
Article 3 and are prevented from gaining 
refugee slatus under article 1 (F) of the 
Refugee Convention because of crimes 
they have committed, are granted 'deferral 
from deportation'. Through this, the United 
States recognises that it is obliged not to 
refoule torture victims but it reserves the 
right to send them to a safe third country 
and the right not to give them permanent 
resident status.56 

Secondly, the Convention against Torture 
does not prevent a state from subjecting a 
person to domestic juri~diction.~' Granting 
an individual protection does not mean 
that that person has been placed above 
the law. Furthermore, torture victims who 
have violated international law, such as 
war criminals or torturers, may be brought 
before the International Criminal Court or 
extradited to a countg where they may be 
tried for their crimes. 

Thirdly, sensationalised claims should not 
be permitted to distort what is actually 
involved in implementing Article 3 of the 
Convention against Torture. Only a small 
number of people seek asylum under the 
Convention against Torture. As noted 
above, torture is an extreme form of abuse 
which is considerably narrower in form 
than "persecution" as defined by the 
Refugee Convention. Of the limited 
number of asylum seekers who are 
covered by the Convention against 
Torture, only a minority will have a criminal 
history. It is important not to compromise 
the prlnclples and objectlves of the 
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Convention against Torture in reaction 
against this small number of individuals. 
To do so would involve passing severe 
moral judgment upon an individual whose 
past actions have been inevitably 
Influenced by a sltuatlon In whlch gross 
human rights abuses threatened them, 
andlor were perpetrated against them. 
Moreover, this severe moral judgment is 
coupled with abrogation of moral 
responsibility on our behalf if we are to 
place individuals at risk of being tortured. 
The question asked should not be, "Why 
should we implement laws which allow 
criminals to enter Australia?", but, "How 
can we retain laws which do not protect 
people from being tortured?". 

Nevertheless, it would be possible to limit 
the application of Article 3 in a similar 
manner to that achieved through the 
exclusions found In Articles 1 and 33 of 
the Refugee Convention discussed above. 

Another difference between those who are 
protected by the Convention against 
Torture and those protected by the 
Refugee Convention is that torture victims 
do not need to be part of a group towards 
which harm is directed. The "nexus" 
requirement of refugee asylum, which 
stipulates that claimants must be able to 
connect their suffering to discrimination 
against a group, is not present in the 
Gonventlon against Torture because of 
the exceptional and often individually 
focused nature of torture. As was the case 
with SE, the "nexus" requirement of the 
Refugee Convention narrows the scope of 
the Torture Convention's protection so as 
to render it ineffective for some asylum 
seekers who have legitimate claims for 
protection based upon severe human 
rights abuse. Both DlMA and the RRT 
determined that SE did not satisfy the 
"nexus" requirement because he could not 
show that he would be persecuted for one 
of the reasons mentioned in Article 33 of 
the Refugee Convention. Yet, as the 
UNCAT found, he was at risk of facing 
torture. His case demonstrates that the 
elements which make up the relevant 
provisions of these Conventions are 
distinct and that claims must be assessed 
separately under each Convention. 

The Minister's Discretion 

From the discussion above it is evident 
that individuals under threat of torture may 
not be refugees because the harm they 
suffer Is not harm suffered by a group, or 
because they do not meet the character 
requirements in the Refugee Convention. 
Australian law has allowed for such torture 
victims by giving the Minister of 
Immigration a discretionary power to grant 
humanitarian visas under s.417 of the 
Migration Act 1958. Unfortunately, torture 
victims such as SE are not adequately 
protected by this discretion, because it is a 
personal discretion exercised by a 
politician in accordance with the public 
interest and not subject to adequate 
review. 

A Personal Discretion 

The Minister has an unenviable task in 
being required to exercise this discretion 
justly in relation to the thousands of 
requests he receives each month. In fact, 
it is an impossible task for one person to 
complete, and it is unreasonable for us to 
expect one person to remedy all the 
problems caused by our inadequate visa 
provisions, considering the time and 
expertise required for such a task. The 
discretion requires the application of 
complex international law principles to 
llurrlerous factual situations. In the context 
of the Refugee Convention, this process 
has required the regular guidance of the 
High ~ o u r t . ~ ~  It is arguable that it may be 
even more difficult to implement the 
Convention against Torture, which is a 
more recent Convention around which 
little jurisprudence has so far developed. 

Only a decision not to consider whether to 
use the dlSCretl0n can be delegated to 
DIMA~' Yet, the problem of inadequate 
expertise is evident at this level as well. 
The case of SE v Australia indicates that 
staff may not be adequately trained to 
identify cases which are covered by the 
Convention against Tnrture. 
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Exercised by a Politician 

Procedural falrness with respect to the 
Minister's discretion is compromised by 
the fact that the Minister is not an 
independent decision maker, in that 
helshe is not independent of immigration 
control and other government  interest^.^' 
As a politician, the Minister may be 
reluctant to exercise this discretion 
because of the possible political 
implications that a decision may have, 
especially since s.417(4) requires that the 
decision be made 

Furthermore, there is evidence which 
suggests that the political leanings of the 
Minister may affect DIMA staff who have 
been delegated the task of deciding 
whether the Minister should consider 
exercising this discretion. In 1995 Cooney 
showed that MIRO officers were 
unwillingly to recommend that the Minister 
use his discretion under s351 (which is 
worded in similar terms to those of S 417) 
because they were concerned that they 
would be labelled critics of government 

Exercised in Accordance with the Public 
Interest 

This discretion must be exercised in the 
"public interest". The relevant "public 
interest" promoted or protected by a 
particular decision must be stated when a 
decision to exercise this discretion is 
tabled before Parliament in accordance 
with s.417(4). The problem here is that the 
focus on the "public interest" diverts 
attention away from, or even contradicts, 
the goal of protecting the basic human 
rights of an individual64- which is the focus 
of the Convention against Torture. 

Inadequate Review 

This discretion is non-compellable and the 
Minister's decision (or that of DlMA staff) 
not to use it cannot be questioned." This 
means that applicants do not receive a 
hearing at all if a decision is made not to 
exercise the discretion. 

When the Minister does exercise this 
discretion, an applicant does not receive 
procedural falrness because hearlngs are 
by written submissions only (which may be 
particularly difficult for non-English 
speaking asylum seekers and those who 
have traumatic stories to relate) and 
applicants do not have effective access to 
jufiicial review because the discretion is 
non-cornpellab~e.~~ Neither can 
unfavourable decisions be reviewed by 
the public because there is no 
requirement that ' they be tabled in 
Parliament or otherwise made public. 

As mentioned above, only a favourable 
decision by the Minister receives a form of 
review. Under s.417(4) the Minister must 
table a favourable decision, with the 
reasons helshe made it, in Parliament. 
However, the quality of such a review is 
affected by the fact that Parliament "may 
lack the time, expertise and political will to 
properly review specific cases".67 

SE v Australia demonstrates how flawed 
this discretion is as a safeguard for torture 
victims.6B In its submission to the UNCAT, 
Australia argued that our domestic law 
had adequately assessed whether SE had 
a genuine claim to protection under Article 
3. Australia relied in part on the fact that 
DlMA had assesed SE's case to 
determine whether it should be referred to 
the Minister, and that the Minister had 
declined to exercise his discretion when 
requested to do so. In light of the 
UNCAT's decision, the competence of the 
Minister and his department to identify 
those in need of Article 3 protection is 
open to question. This emphasises the 
need for judicial review of the exercise of 
the Minister's discretion, something which 
was unavailable to SE.~' 

Deportation 

Under s198 of the Act, an unlawful non- 
citizen7' must be removed from 
A~stralia.~' That section states that an 
"officer must remove as soon as 
reasonably practicable" an unlawful non- 
citizen who is detained and who does not 
have a valid visa or visa application. In SE 
v Mlnl~ter,'~ SE argued that this provisiur~ 
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must be read as not requiring the removal 
of individuals to a place where their 
human rights risked violation, because 
such an action would breach Australia's 
obligations under international treaties 
such as the Convention against Torture. It 
was held that the operation of this section 
was not limited in this way as a matter of 
statutory constr~ction.~~ 

In practice this means that the nature of 
the destination to which someone is to be 
removed and whether they will suffer 
human rights abuses at this destination 
are not considered during the deportation 
process. The justification is that such 
issues have already been sufficiently 
considered by those who examined the 
individual's visa application.74 Thus, in SE 
v Minister, when an officer of DlMA was 
asked whether he had examined the 
conditions in Somalia (where the appellant 
was to be sent) before he exercised his 
statutory duty to remove the appellant 
from Australia he answered, "No, that had 
already been donen. When asked, "By 
whom?", he replied, "...the RRT 
process"." The flaw within such reasoning 
is evident from the discussion above. Not 
all applicants to whom Australia has an 
obligation not the remove under Article 3 
of the Convention against Torture wlll be 
able to obtain a visa under our current 
provisions. 

Recommendations for change 

Although the Convention against Torture 
is a relatively recent Convention which has 
yet to be widely implemented, Australia 
may look to the example of other 
countries, such as Germany and the 
United States, in assessing how it may 
provide for its Article 3 obligations within 
lts lmmlgratlon laws. Article 3 ot the 
Convention against Torture is reflected in 
Germany's immigration law, both in its 
visa provisions and its mechanisms for 
deportation review. Under s53 of the 
Aliens Act of Germany, asylum seekers 
will not be deported if they are in "concrete 
danger" of being subjected to torture 
[s52(1)]. Under s53(6) of the same Act, 
deportation can be prevented if an asylum 

seeker's life, bodily integrity or freedom is 
under immediate and personal danger.76 

The United States has gone further than 
Germany to guarantee asylum seekers 
relief based upon the Convention against 
Torture. Within United States law, 
although torture victims cannot seek 
redress under Article 22 of the Convention 
against ~ o r t u r e , ~ ~  they have been able to 
apply directly for the protection of Article 3 
since its ratification by the United States in 
1994.~' In 199811999, the United States 
implemented a new procedure which 
integrates determinations under the 
Convention against Torture into the 
asylum adjudication process. This 
procedure allows asylum seekers to apply 
for relief under the Convention against 
Torture at any stage during their 
proceedings. Moreover, Immigration & 
Naturalisation Service officials and 
immigration judges are trained to raise 
Convention against Torture claims 
themselves when they think that is 
appropriate. One of the most significant 
features of these provisions is that they 
recognise that humanitarian status is not 
discretionary, but required for individuals 
who qualify for protection under the 
Convention against ~orture.~' 

Through its reluctance to give full effect to 
its obligations under Article 3, Australia is 
failing to play its part in eliminating torture. 
In view of this, Australia should follow the 
lead of the United States and create a 
separate ground of relief for asylum 
seekers modelled on the features of 
Article 3 of the Convention against 
Torture. 

Conclusion 

The case ot S t  vAustralra draws attention 
to the fact that Australia has failed to 
provide adequate protection for asylum 
seekers who are at risk of torture. 
Although Australia has claimed otherwise, 
a close examination of our on-shore cl 866 
protection visa and the Minister's 
discretion under S 417 to grant visas on 
humanitarian grounds shows that these 
mechanisms do not adequately protect 
individuals covered by Article 3 of the 
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Convention against Torture. In order to 
remedy this situation two changes should 
be made to the Migration Act 1958. Firstly, 
a visa class should be created which is 
based upon Article 3 of the Convention 
against ~or tu re? '  Secondly, deportation 
orders ought to be reviewable by 
reference to Article 3 of the Convention. 
Such  measures will demonstrate that 
Australia is committed to the world-wide 
elimination of torture. 
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